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Love and marriage don't have to be strangers...

Gambling. Carousing. Flirting. Charlotte, Duchess of Rutherford, will do
anything to escape her painful marriage and force her husband to divorce her. But
when Phillip, Duke of Rutherford, promises a divorce if Charlotte will help him
become a better husband for another woman, she wonders if she really wants to
lose him...
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Gambling. Carousing. Flirting. Charlotte, Duchess of Rutherford, will do anything to escape her painful
marriage and force her husband to divorce her. But when Phillip, Duke of Rutherford, promises a divorce if
Charlotte will help him become a better husband for another woman, she wonders if she really wants to lose
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Editorial Review

From Booklist
After three years of ignoring her, Philip Burgess, the Duke of Rutherford, realizes he wants his wife,
Charlotte, back. The problem is that Charlotte doesn’t seem to want to Phillip back, as evidenced by her
scandalous behavior and repeated requests for a divorce. Of course, when Phillip finally does offer to grant
Charlotte the divorce she so desperately desires, she is somewhat suspicious, especially since the offer comes
with a condition. Phillip wants Charlotte to “teach” him how to be a better husband, supposedly so that he
can successfully court his former fiancée, Lady Joanna Grey. What Charlotte doesn’t know is that the lessons
are really a ruse, a way for Phillip to win back the only woman he truly loves: his wife. With its addictive
combination of richly nuanced characters, elegant writing spiced with a soupçon of wicked wit, and
abundance of sizzling sexual chemistry, March’s exceptional debut is literary gold. --John Charles

Review
"With its addictive combination of richly nuanced characters, elegant writing spiced with a soupton of
wicked wit, and abundance of sizzling sexual chemistry, March's exceptional debut is literary gold."
-Booklist, 9/15/10

About the Author
Ashley March is a writer of historical romance fiction. Her works include My Lady Rival, Seducing the
Duchess, Romancing Lady Cecily, and Romancing the Countess. A native of Texas, she currently resides in
Denver with her husband, two daughters, and two dogs.

Users Review

From reader reviews:

Jon McKibben:

The book Seducing the Duchess make you feel enjoy for your spare time. You can use to make your capable
considerably more increase. Book can to be your best friend when you getting anxiety or having big problem
along with your subject. If you can make studying a book Seducing the Duchess to become your habit, you
can get more advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your knowledge about many or all
subjects. You can know everything if you like open and read a reserve Seducing the Duchess. Kinds of book
are several. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you think about
this book?

Trey Olivas:

The book Seducing the Duchess can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. Why
must we leave the great thing like a book Seducing the Duchess? Several of you have a different opinion
about book. But one aim this book can give many details for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer
using your book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you can give for each other; you are able to share
all of these. Book Seducing the Duchess has simple shape but you know: it has great and massive function
for you. You can appearance the enormous world by open up and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

http://localhost/gp/feature.html/?docId=1000027801


Homer Anderson:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive at this point, people
have do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and
notice by surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated it for a while is reading.
Yep, by reading a e-book your ability to survive increase then having chance to stand up than other is high.
In your case who want to start reading a new book, we give you this particular Seducing the Duchess book as
beginner and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Ruby Martinez:

Some people said that they feel bored when they reading a book. They are directly felt that when they get a
half portions of the book. You can choose typically the book Seducing the Duchess to make your reading is
interesting. Your personal skill of reading skill is developing when you including reading. Try to choose easy
book to make you enjoy to read it and mingle the sensation about book and reading especially. It is to be 1st
opinion for you to like to open a book and learn it. Beside that the publication Seducing the Duchess can to
be your new friend when you're really feel alone and confuse with the information must you're doing of the
time.
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